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W E S T  D E S  M O I N E S
1415 28th Street, Suite 325
West Des Moines, IA 50266

phone 515.283.5101
fax 515.283.5102

W A T E R L O O
314 East 4th Street
Waterloo, IA 50703

phone 319.234.1515
fax 319.234.1517

A R C H I T E C T U R E

I N T E R I O R  D E S I G N

M A S T E R  P L A N N I N G

ALL BRANCH ADDENDUM #1 
 
Date:  Wednesday, June 06, 2012  
To:  All Contractors Bidding The 
Project:  Cardinal Middle-Senior High School 2012 Entrance, Science & Cafeteria Remodel 
Bid Date: Bids Received Monday, June 11, 2012 at 2:00 P.M. (Local Time) 
From:  Pam Johnson, AIA 
 
Ladies & Gentlemen: 
 
Please make the following corrections or changes to the bidding documents.  These items shall supersede, 
modify and/or change all statements or drawings to the contrary in the plans and specifications and shall 
take precedence over these documents.  Bidders shall base their bid on the plans and specifications as 
modified by the changes herein specified. 
 
Product Substitution Approvals: 
  

072726  TK-AirMax 2102 NP    
 087100  Besam AES - Powerswing 

087100  Stanley Magic Force 
123200  Northwest Cabinets Inc. 

 
 
Modifications to the Specifications: 
 
1. Supplementary Instructions to Bidders 

Under 3.1.5 List of Drawings and Specifications, under Specifications please add “Mechanical & 
Electrical Divisions 22, 23, 26, 27 and 28”. 
 

2. Section 084113 – Aluminum-Framed Entrances and Storefronts 
Under 2.8 Aluminum Finishes, contractor to be aware that the color anodic finish will be used at  
Area “C” and the High-Performance Organic Finish will be required at Area “B”. 
 

3. Section 096813 – Tile Carpeting 
Under 2.1 Carpet Tile, please add the following: 
 2. Bigelow, Bending Earth Collection 
  a.   Color:  As selected by Architect from manufacturer’s full range. 
  b.   Size:  24” x 24” 

 
 
Modifications to the Architectural Drawings: 
 
1. Sheet A101 – Floor Plan – Area “A” 

Please add wall type “GYP” – adhered gypsum board, to the north and south walls of A100 Prep 
Room and the north wall of the hallway in A102 Science where door A102C is located.  In rooms 
A101 Janitor and A103 Storage, salvage some of the wood paneling from the walls that are being 
demoed and use it to patch back in-filled door openings in these rooms as required to match existing. 

 
2. Sheet A101 – Demo Notes 

For note #13, please be aware that the mastic will be removed along with the floor tile under separate 
contract as well.  

 
 
 

GENERAL CONTRACT

2 of 2

PROJECT:

BID DATE/TIME:

ARCHITECT:

CONTRACTOR

BID SECURITY

ADDENDA

No     

BASIS BID

ALTERNATE #1 - ADD
Re-injection well #2.
ALTERNATE #2 - DEDUCT
Remove all landscape plantings.
ALTERNATE #3 - ADD/DEDUCT
Electric Traction Elevators in lieu of 
Hydraulic.
ALTERNATE #4 - DEDUCT
Delete Site furnishings.
ALTERNATE #5 - DEDUCT
Delete wall mats.
ALTERNATE #6 - DEDUCT
Delete all work associated with the storm 
shelter.
ALTERNATE #7 - ADD
Add fiber optic line from middle school to 
LSI.
ALTERNATE #8 - ADD/DEDUCT
Substitute/replace Grundfos domestic 
booster pump system (P-11) with an 
approved manufacturer.
ALTERNATE #9 - ADD/DEDUCT
Use Pella Impervia sliding windows & 
separate blinds in lieu of aluminum dual 
glazed horizontal slider windows w/ integral 
blinds.
ALTERNATE #10 - ADD 
CI-3/Andover temp control.
ALTERNATE #11 - ADD 
Controls Service/Alerton temp control.
ALTERNATE #12 - ADD  
Cotnrol System Specialist/American Auto 
Matrix temp comtrol.
ALTERNATE #13 - ADD 
Engineered Controls/Honeywell temp 
control.
ALTERNATE #14 - ADD 
FM Controls/Reliable temp control.
ALTERNATE #15 - ADD 
Halverson-Trane temp control.
ALTERNATE #16 - ADD 
Johnson Controls temp control.
ALTERNATE #17 - ADD 
Siemens Bulding Technology temp control.

ALTERNATE #18 - ADD 
Woodman Controls/Talon temp Control.

UNIT PRICES:

Overexcavating/Engineered Fill $/cu yd

Rock Clause - Elevator $/ft                

MAJOR SUBCONTRACTORS:

MechanicalAn    

Electrical

CONTRACTOR COMPLETION DATE

NEW MIDDLE SCHOOL FOR WAVERLY-SHELL ROCK CSD, WAVERLY, IA

TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 10, 2009 @ 2:00 P.M. (Local Time)

Craig D. Schwerdtfeger PH: 319-234-1515 ~ FAX: 319-234-1517

LARSON 
CONSTRUCTION 

CO.                                   
Independence, IA

MIRON 
CONSTRUCTION                 

Neenah, WI

SHAW-LINQUIST 
ASSOCIATES                                            
St. Paul , MN

STAHL 
CONSTRUCTION         
St. Louis Park, MN

THE SAMUELS 
GROUP, INC.                           
Wausau, WI

5%-AIA 5%-AIA 5%-AIA 5%-AIA 5%-AIA

1, 2, 3 & 4 1, 2, 3 & 4 1, 2, 3 & 4 1, 2, 3 & 4 1, 2, 3 & 4

August 1, 2011 August 1, 2011 August 1, 2011 August 1, 2011 July 31, 2011

No later than August 1, 2011 No later than August 1, 2011 No later than August 1, 2011 No later than August 1, 2011 No later than August 1, 2011

$21,525,000.00 $21,980,000.00 $23,338,000.00 $21,750,000.00 $23,420,000.00

$50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $7.00

$52.00 $350.00 $760.00 $650.00 $40.00

Andy's Plumbing & Heating Andy's Plumbing & Heating Andy's Plumbing & Heating Andy's Plumbing & Heating Young Plumbing & Heating

Circuit Electric Circuit Electric Circuit Electric Circuit Electric Circuit Electric

AWARDED

$147,000.00 $138,181.00 $139,000.00 $140,000.00

$275,000.00 $273,580.00 $274,000.00 $275,000.00

$185,000.00 $180,734.00 $170,000.00 $185,000.00

$241,000.00 $24,020.00 $238,000.00 $240,000.00

$268,000.00

$302,000.00 $300,728.00 $298,000.00 $300,000.00

$503,000.00

$310,000.00 $308,036.00 $305,000.00 $5,000.00

$181,000.00

$501,208.00 $495,000.00 $500,000.00

NO BID $700,000.00 NO BID $500,000.00

$345,000.00

$492,000.00

$295,000.00

$236,000.00

$302,000.00

$338,000.00 $339,360.00 $337,000.00

$324,000.00

NO BID

($16,000.00) ($51,566.00) $39,000.00 ($50,000.00)

($1,876.00) ($2,000.00) ($2,000.00)

$330,000.00

$330,000.00

$323,700.00 $320,000.00 $315,000.00

$29,000.00 $30,000.00

($69,000.00)

NO BID

($1,600,000.00) ($1,700,000.00)

$28,000.00 $28,538.00

($1,820,000.00)

$28,000.00

($1,900.00)

($1,846,000.00) ($1,754,000.00)

($11,600.00) ($8,500.00)($16,600.00) ($8,000.00) ($10,000.00)

($5,100.00)($41,000.00) ($35,000.00) ($25,000.00) ($1,000.00)

$14,500.00 $14,084.00

($15,000.00) ($23,000.00)

$143,500.00

($23,000.00)

$8,700.00$15,000.00 $50,000.00

($15,618.00)($14,960.00)
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   Document A101TM – 2007 
Standard Form of Agreement Between Owner and Contractor where the basis of 
payment is a Stipulated Sum 

 

Init. 

/ 

AIA Document A101™ – 2007. Copyright © 1915, 1918, 1925, 1937, 1951, 1958, 1961, 1963, 1967, 1974, 1977, 1987, 1991, 1997 and 2007 by The American 
Institute of Architects. All rights reserved. WARNING: This AIA®  Document is protected by U.S. Copyright Law and International Treaties. Unauthorized 
reproduction or distribution of this AIA®  Document, or any portion of it, may result in severe civil and criminal penalties, and will be prosecuted to the 
maximum extent possible under the law. This document was produced by AIA software at 13:24:44 on 12/10/2009 under Order No.1000367524_1 which expires 
on 08/21/2010, and is not for resale. 
User Notes:   (727856206) 

 
1 

 

ADDITIONS AND DELETIONS:  
The author of this document has 
added information needed for its 
completion. The author may also 
have revised the text of the original 
AIA standard form. An Additions and 
Deletions Report that notes added 
information as well as revisions to the 
standard form text is available from 
the author and should be reviewed. A 
vertical line in the left margin of this 
document indicates where the author 
has added necessary information 
and where the author has added to or 
deleted from the original AIA text. 

This document has important legal 
consequences. Consultation with an 
attorney is encouraged with respect 
to its completion or modification. 

AIA Document A201™–2007, 
General Conditions of the Contract 
for Construction, is adopted in this 
document by reference. Do not use 
with other general conditions unless 
this document is modified. 

AGREEMENT made as of the Seventeenth day of November in the year  Two Thousand 
Nine  
(In words, indicate day, month and year) 
 
BETWEEN the Owner: 
(Name, address and other information) 
 
Waverly-Shell Rock Community School District   
1415 4th Avenue S.W. 
Waverly, IA  50677 
Telephone Number: (319) 352-3630 
Fax Number: (319) 352-5676 
 
and the Contractor: 
(Name, address and other information) 
 
Larson Construction Co., Inc.,  
600 17th Street, SE 
PO Box 112 
Independence, IA 50644 
Telephone Number: 319-334-7061 
Fax Number: 319-334-4474 
 
for the following Project: 
(Name, location, and detailed description) 
 
New Middle School for Waverly-Shell Rock Community School District,  
Waverly, IA 
   
 
The Architect: 
(Name, address and other information) 
 
StruXture Architects, PLC   
314 East 4th Street 
Waterloo, IA  50703 
Telephone Number: 319-234-1515 
Fax Number: 319-234-1517 
 
The Owner and Contractor agree as follows. 
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OBSERVATION REPORT 
 
Project:  Waverly – Shell Rock CSD, Southeast Elementary Reroof 
Date:  Wednesday, June 11, 2014 – 12:00 pm   
Weather:  Sunny   Temp: 78°F 
Complete%: 45% +/- 
Observer: Ted Friesner 
 
Work in Progress: 

x Installing termination bars at north face of cafeteria. (1 roofer) 
x Flashing and reinstalling existing roof curbs. (1 roofer) 
x Installing lap sealant at seams around roof penetrations. (1 roofer) 

 
  
Observations: 

x 5 roofers on site. 
x Existing roof membrane has been removed from the lower portion of the south addition, with the 

exception of the roof over the mechanical room. 
x New 60 mil roofing membrane has been loose laid and mechanically fastened to existing parapet 

blocking at all areas where existing roof has been removed. 
x Rock ballast has been spread over the west and south portions of the roof. 
x Rock ballast is staged on the east and west sides of the building. 
x Overall site and work areas are clean, no clutter. 

 
Other Items: 

x Spoke briefly with Nate Grady (site supervisor).  Tentatively scheduled to complete the south 
(ballasted) roofs this week.  Nate stated they will probably bring additional people on site starting 
Monday to help with the removal of the north roof.  Hawkeye Sheet Metal is scheduled to be on-
site next week to field measure for the metal copings. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Factory markings indicating 
60mil roofing membrane (as 
specified). 

Finished portion of roof, west side 
of cafeteria. 
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PROJECT BUDGET/EXPENSE SUMMARY
ADDITIONS & RENOVATIONS TO THOMAS R. ROBERTS HIGH SCHOOL
July 14, 2014

A B C B+C

CONTRACTS

Construction Contract
    Building  $18,730,500.00 $18,619,211.47 Larson Construction $111,288.53 $18,730,500.00
    Contract Adjustments ($215,616.86) ($154,189.65) ($61,427.21) ($215,616.86)
    General Allowance $900,000.00 $804,339.24 $95,660.76 $900,000.00
    Plaque Allowance $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $0.00 $2,000.00
    Site Sign Allowance $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $0.00 $2,000.00
    CAD As‐Built Allowance $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $7,500.00
    Construction Set Allowance $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $7,500.00
    Building Total $19,433,883.14 $19,288,361.06 $145,522.08 $19,433,883.14

Professional Fees (A/E) $1,055,281.55 $1,053,047.46 StruXture Architects $2,234.09 $1,055,281.55
    Weekly Observations $98,247.50 $96,891.68 StruXture Architects $1,355.82 $98,247.50

Miscellaneous Expenses (Variables)
    Consultant Reimbursables $24,186.98 $24,186.98 $0.00 $24,186.98
    Reimbursables $69,493.40 $69,341.09 $152.31 $69,493.40
    

TOTAL PROJECT  EXPENSE $20,681,092.57 $20,681,092.57

CURRENT EXPENSE SUMMARY

Budget 
Amount

Contract 
Amount Contractor

Contract 
Change Total Expense
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ALLOWANCE LOG 
G-11 ($37,781.21) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ($37,781.21) 03/21/12

BALANCE $681,231.53 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $692,731.53

G-12 ($865.71) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ($865.71) 03/30/12

BALANCE $680,365.82 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $691,865.82

G-13 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 04/18/12

BALANCE $680,365.82 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $691,865.82

G-14 ($12,118.15) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ($12,118.15) 04/18/12

BALANCE $668,247.67 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $679,747.67

G-15 ($16,520.90) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ($16,520.90) 05/30/12

BALANCE $651,726.77 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $663,226.77

G-16 ($29,818.99) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ($29,818.99) 07/02/12

BALANCE $621,907.78 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $633,407.78

G-17 ($32,096.59) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ($32,096.59) 07/11/12

BALANCE $589,811.19 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $601,311.19

G-18 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 07/18/12

BALANCE $589,811.19 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $601,311.19

G-19 ($114,280.10) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ($114,280.10) 07/18/12

BALANCE $475,531.09 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $487,031.09

G-20 ($621.30) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ($621.30) 07/18/12

BALANCE $474,909.79 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $486,409.79

G-21 ($41,686.99) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ($41,686.99) 07/25/12

BALANCE $433,222.80 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $444,722.80

G-22 ($117,342.48) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ($117,342.48) 09/28/12

BALANCE $315,880.32 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $327,380.32

G-23 ($21,250.94) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ($21,250.94) 11/05/12

BALANCE $294,629.38 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $306,129.38

G-24 ($5,890.30) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ($5,890.30) 11/05/12

BALANCE $288,739.08 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $300,239.08

G-25 ($21,366.35) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ($21,366.35) 12/13/12

BALANCE $267,372.73 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $278,872.73

G-26 ($5,923.65) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ($5,923.65) 12/19/12

BALANCE $261,449.08 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $272,949.08

G-27 ($14,530.55) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ($14,530.55) 01/17/13

BALANCE $246,918.53 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $258,418.53

G-28 ($28,687.36) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ($28,687.36) 03/12/13

BALANCE $218,231.17 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $229,731.17

G-29 ($7,253.34) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ($7,253.34) 04/05/13

BALANCE $210,977.83 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $222,477.83

G-30 ($13,886.05) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ($13,886.05) 04/23/13

BALANCE $197,091.78 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $208,591.78

G-31 ($19,866.25) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ($19,866.25) 05/17/13

BALANCE $177,225.53 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $188,725.53

G-32 ($6,972.45) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ($6,972.45) 07/08/13

BALANCE $170,253.08 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $181,753.08

G-33 ($20,479.20) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ($20,479.20) 07/08/13

BALANCE $149,773.88 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $161,273.88

G-34 ($11,171.61) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ($11,171.61) 07/31/13

BALANCE $138,602.27 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $150,102.27

G-35 ($5,499.30) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ($5,499.30) 09/30/13

BALANCE $133,102.97 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $144,602.97
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